
                 

  January is a slow month in the tourist 
trade. Rob is sound asleep in Niffen Hol-
low while the mouse family check out the 
art  work down at Flight of Fancy. JoAnn 
and Terry went south for the winter so 
forget getting any hand made chocolate to 
chase away your winter blues. Speaking of 
blues, there's lots of the music variety eve-
ry Thursday afternoon 1 to 3 at Sissiboo 
Cafe with George and Alex. They'll also be 
at Myrtle and Rosies, Jan 26th at 7 pm. 
Special guests Harold Clapp and Sharon 
Constable turn up the heat. You can be 
sure the artists are cozy in their studios 
creating treasures (see page 3). The snow 
plow will be in Greenland eventually and 
we’ll keep waiting for the old elm tree to 
blow down so we can get some firewood. 
Otherwise, it's bundle up, grab the shovel 
and dig your car out, one more time. 
             Happy Winter Everybody!  

  Volume 1 Issue 7  January 2018   

Free 

Good Coffee Deserves Good News 

Get all your supplies in downtown 
Bear River.  NSLC, Cut Meats, ATM, 
Lottery tickets, Grocery, Friendly Ser-
vice, Cigs, and all the Latest News. 
Artwork for sign above by Janelle Weir 
Paint on Rustic Slab Wood. See  other 
pieces in store. Her  #  902-308-1226 

                      Snow Shoveling 
      Cleaning   Wood Piling Services 
                  20.00$  an hour Firm 
       902-837-5454  or  902-378-2036 
   Please leave  address and phone  # 

 
     mandybertaux@hotmail.com 

George Sloane..Musician and Good Guy 
Many of you may have seen George 

around Bear River and Digby over the 
past few years. As a come-from-away he 
certainly has solidified his presence here. 

Always a cheerful smile and friendly 
greeting, he even makes the locals feel 

welcome. An excellent guitar and mando-
lin player as well as MC and all around co-
ordinator of events from benefits to Cher-
ry Carnivals, he keeps busy. Between his 
part time jobs delivering flyers and keep-
ing the Church warm he made an impres-

sive ride across the Rocky Mountains 
from Victoria to Calgary on his bicycle last 

summer. Lately you might see him and 
Alex, his musical partner, at the Sissiboo 
Cafe on a Thursday afternoon. I know he 

keeps his crib game polished up with Wal-
ter Ruggles. Walter helped with the resto-

ration of their Upper River Road home 
when he and partner Susan Friend first 
moved to Bear River. Now they live on 

Pleasant Street and George does his musi-
cal rehearsing in his studio there. (see ad 

on page 2) Ecclectica is his duo group 
with Rev. Alex  Constable on flute, saxo-
phone and percussion. You can be sure 

they put on a good show with their diverse 
collection of blues, jazz, rock and folk 

music. I wonder how they 
decided on the name Ecclectica ??? hmm 

“Sydney” The K-Pal of The Month 
           from Sydney/Halifax NS 
See Issue 5, page 2 at digbycafe.ca for  the 
inside scoop on what K-Pal is all about. 

       Getting Fixed at the Haul Up 
            Artwork by Sally O’Grady 
      Round Hill Studio Annapolis Royal 

Visit us at www.digbycafe.ca See beautiful 
artwork in colour. Add one of your email 
addresses to insure you get the latest copy 
of the flyer. Also, access to past issues. 

  Hansi Gerold-Murphy 
             (acrylic) 
         Ted Coldwell  
     (photo-sculpture) 
           Brad Hall  
     (metal-sculpture) 

                  Image credit:  

            Jamie Lee Lightle 

            Round Hill Studio    902-955-036          
              280 St George St. Annapolis Royal 
 roundhillstudio.com   info@roundhillstudio.com 
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Starcia McCue 

902-467-4198 

Two Entrepreneurs showing persistence 
and ingenuity. Starcia McCue from Bear 
River and Gary Mullen from Digby are not 
only dreaming of things they might do but 
get right down to putting one foot in front 
of the other, getting off their butts, and 
actually doing something. With the latest 
scourge of snow they have put their hands 
to a very practical and age old solution to 
making a buck. It doesn’t look like they will 
be out of business anytime soon. Being an 
Entrepreneur takes a certain kind of person 
who has the imagination to see the future 
and is not afraid of the  hard work it might 
take to get there. They are people who will 
always have an exciting journey and never 
a dull day. Hats off to these two rugged 
individuals, a couple of real Entrpreneurs. 

http://www.digbycafe.ca/
https://clyp.it/user/ygarwrko
http://www.roundhillstudio.com
http://www.roundhillstudio.com/

